
Experimental charge density study of salicylaldehyde 
thiosemicarbazone  
Sladjana Novakovica, Goran Bogdanovica, Vukadin Leovacb, Bernard 
Fraissec, Nour Eddine Ghermanic,d, Anne Spasojevic-de Biréc, aVINČA 
Institute of Nuclear Sciences, PO Box 522, 11001 Belgrade, Serbia 
and Montenegro; bDepartment of Chemistry, University of Novi Sad, 
21000 Novi Sad, Serbia and Montenegro; cLaboratoire SPMS, UMR 
8580 CNRS, Ecole Centrale Paris, 92295 Châtenay-Malabry, France. 
dLaboratoire PPB, UMR 8612 CNRS, Université Paris XI, Faculté de 
Pharmacie, 92296 Châtenay-Malabry cedex, France. E-mail: 
snovak@vin.bg.ac.yu 
 

Thiosemicarbazones and their metal complexes are studied due to 
their wide biological activities spectrum, analytical applications and 
specific chemical and structural properties [1]. Up to date almost a 
thousand thiosemicarbazide based crystal structures have been 
reported, among them over one hundred were structures containing 
salicylaldehyde thiosemicarbazone (Sal-TSC) structural fragment. Sal-
TSC and its derivates have been recently reported as a potential 
thrombopoetin mimic agents [2], and two thiosemicarbazone based 
molecules are in clinical phase I due to to their inhibitor activity 
against ribonucleotide reductase [3]. Here, we present an experimental 
charge density study of one of the most simple compound [4] of this 
family, in order to characterize the electronic and electrostatic 
properties of this potent pharmacophore fragment. 
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